



City of Brockville
 Contract 2016-28
Supply of Floating Docks
 City of Brockville Islands

BID OPEN

Bid Close
 2016 08 30 1:15 p.m.

Bidder Name	Amount Bid (inclusive of HST)	Comments
1 Pye Property Contact: Benjamin Pye Tele:	NO BID	
2 Techno Marine Group 91 rue de Normandie, Suite 201 Repentigny, QC J6A 7B3 Contact: Ana Smith Tele: 450.585.6114, ext. 229	NO BID	
3 J.S. Simpson Welding 4079 County Road 29, RR 4 Brockville, ON K6V 5T4 Contact: Tele: 613.342.1403	\$54,240.-	INCLUDES HST
4 Poralu Marine 345 Boul. Industriel St-Eustache, QC J4R 6C9 Contact: Stephen Fischer Tele: 416.389.4429	NO BID	
5 Kropf Industrial Inc. 1 Quebec Drive Seguin, ON P2A 0B2 Contact: Jordan Kropf Tele: 888.480.3777, ext. 238	NO BID	
6 Bruce Custom Fabricating 1632 Chemong Road Selwin, ON K9J 6X2 Contact: Norah Montgomery Tele: 705.743.0414	NO BID	
7 Jean Daoust Construction Inc. 560 Lacolle Way, Suite 101 Ottawa, ON K4A 0N9 Contact: Jean Daoust Tele: 613.590.1694	NO BID	
8 Pipefusion Services Inc. Contact: Chris Ivanov Tele: 705.789.9411	\$34,079.-	with HST INCLUDED
9 King Industries Inc. Mississauga, ON L5L 2L8 Contact: Brad King Tele: 416.253.9329	NO BID	
10 Huron District Contracting Limited 100 North Harbour Road West Goderich, ON N7A 4C6 Contact: Carrie Robson Tele: 519.524.9237	NO BID	
11 Dean Construction Company Limited. Contact: Oleg Kovalenko Tele: 519.734.8999, ext. 15	NO BID	
12 Pride Marine Group (GM - Pride Docking Div.) Contact: Blair Moffatt Tele: 705.242.7614	NO BID	

13 Arrow Docks, LLC 4954 East 7th Street Joplin, MO 64801 Contact: Dale Coffey Tele: 417.437.7520	NO BID	
14 Ravens Marine Inc. Contact: Kayleigh Hill Tele: 407.935.9799	#41,399.-	INCLUDES HST
15 1000 Islands Marine Construction P.O. Box 299 Gananoque, ON K7G 2T8 Contact: John Bishop Tele: 613.382.2366	#39,211.-	INCLUDES HST
16 Ottawa Construction Association 196 Bronson Ave Ottawa, ON K1R 6H4 Contact: Karen Holzhter Tele: 613.236.0488	NO BID	
17 Power Marine Centre 16 Old River Road Rockport, ON K0E 1V0 Contact: Terry Flanigan Tele: 613.659.3831	NO BID	
18 Kehoe Marine Construction 515 1000 Islands Parkway Lansdowne, ON K0E 1L0 Contact: Steve Moore Tele: 613.659.4626	#27,402.50	INCLUDES HST
19 Dock Hardware & Marine Fabrication South Carolina Office Contact: Matt Stevenson Tele: 843.365.5567	NO BID	
20 Hewitt (Brockville) Ltd. 200 Laurier Blvd. Brockville, ON Contact: Gord Cameron Tele: 613.342.7903	#49,042.-	INCLUDES HST
21 Plum Hollow Excavating 802 Plum Hollow Road Athens, ON K0E 1B0 Contact: Terrance Knapp Tele: 613.802.0941	NO BID	
22 Contact: Tele:		
23 Contact: Tele:		
24 Contact: Tele:		
25 Contact: Tele:		
26 Contact: Tele:		

Contract 2016-28, Supply of Floating Docks

ATTENDANCE

August 30, 2016 1:15 p.m.
(date & time)

Russ Fraser, City of Brockville

*The purpose of the tender opening is to publicly announce and record every bid received, with the exception of late bids. Bidders should note that the pricing information read out today is **PRELIMINARY** in nature only and should not be construed as an indication of which Bidder is being awarded the contract. All documentation is subject to review for mathematical accuracies, compliance with specifications, and compliance with the terms and conditions of the contract, the completion of which will ultimately determine the successful Bidder.*